
Assistant Professor, Gerontology,
Simon Fraser University, Vancouver, Canada

The Gerontology Department at Simon Fraser University invites applications for a three-
year limited-term position at the Assistant Professor rank beginning  September 1, 2005 or
January 1, 2006. The successful candidate will teach four courses each year. Priority courses
include:  Introduction  to Gerontology, Health  Promotion  and Aging,  Health  and Illness in
Later Life, and Research Methods in Gerontology. Previous teaching in gerontology is an
asset.  Other  duties  will  include  initiating  or  continuing  research  and  participating  in
departmental committee work. Candidates should have a PhD or equivalent. Salary will be
commensurate with experience and qualifications. See policy A20.02 for the salary scale on
the  SFU  web  site.  The  Department,  established  in  1983,  currently  offers  a  minor  in
Gerontology, a Post Baccalaureate Diploma, and a Master’s Degree and is proposing a Ph.D.
program. SFU is at the leading edge of gerontological research and education in Canada, and
has a reputation as one of the best comprehensive universities in the country. All qualified
candidates are encouraged to apply; however,  Canadians and permanent  residents will  be
given priority. SFU is committed to the principle of equity in employment and offers equal
opportunities to qualified women and men, including visible minorities, aboriginal people and
persons with disabilities. This position is subject to budgetary approval. Applicants should
include a covering letter, curriculum vitae, two samples of their publications, and the names
of  three  references.  Applications  should  arrive  no  later  than  May  31,  2005.  Address
correspondence to: Professor Andrew Wister, Chair, Department of Gerontology, 515 West
Hastings, Vancouver, B.C. V6B 5K3, Canada. (wister@sfu.ca). For further information about
the Department of Gerontology, please see our web site at: www.sfu.ca/gerontology/.


